
MOTHER’S DAY SPECIALS

TO COMMENCE WITH               
A variety of Mediterranean seasonal antipasti, 
natural and composed salads, selection of 
marinated fish, shellfish, creative charcuterie 
platters and vegetarian dishes, complimented with 
a variety of condiments, sauces and dressings.

SOUPS
Broccoli and Stilton soup   

Thai seafood soup

PIZZA & PASTA 
Traditional Pizza Margarita

Capricciosa - Ham, eggs, artichoke and olives.

Cannelloni with ricotta and spinach gratin with 
bechamel sauce and parmesan cheese

Strozzapretti with mussels, clams, shrimps and 
calamari, pan fried with cherry tomatoes, garlic, 
parsley and white wine

Ravioli cacio e peppe with crispy guanciale, butter 
noisette and pecorino shavings

Farfalle all’ortolana with tomato sauce, mushrooms, 
peas, zucchini, peppers and rucola

CARVERY
Chicken roulade, stuffed with aromatic beef and 
served with a jus reduction with prunes

Roasted lamb rump seasoned with fresh rosemary, 
served with mint Greek yoghurt dressing

MAIN COURSE
Grilled fillets of brown meagre served with lemon 
and aromatic herb butter.

Baked Salmon crusted with pistachio and aromatic 
herbs, served with honey garlic sauce

Grilled duck breast served 
with orange jus reduction

Medallions of beef served with caramelized shallots 
and a reduction of port wine

VEGAN DISHES                                                                                                                                           
Baked truffle flavoured polenta with tofu, 
mushrooms and olive crumble  

Root vegetable tartine with roasted onions    

Vegetarian Moussaka    

Vegetable Biryani   

INDIAN LIVE STATION    
Pulled Goan pork

Chicken Korma

Kerala fish curry

Lamb Madras

Steamed rice      

Mumbai potato                                                                                                        

Crispy vegetable samosas     

Complimented with naan bread, crispy papadums, 
pickles and chutneys.

ACCOMPANIMENTS  
Panache of steamed vegetables dressed with olive 
oil and fresh herbs

Glazed celeriac, carrots and onions                                                                                                                  

Pan fried green beans topped with roasted almonds                                                                                                                                          

Roasted potatoes with sundried tomatoes black 
olives and thyme

French fries

SWEET DREAMS  
A wide selection of mouth-watering desserts, 
classics cakes with a twist and traditional bakes, 
tarts and gateaux, Variety of local and continental 
cheeses served with various crackers, condiments, 
dried fruits, and fresh fruit display.

KID’S ZONE  
Pasta, steamed vegies, Chicken nuggets, 
French fries

Price: €55.00 per person, Children 6 - 11 years at €27.50 per child
Inclusive of: Free-flowing house wine, house beer, minerals, tea and coffee, as well as 3-hours free parking, subject to availability.

Vegetarian Vegan


